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OFF THE FAIRWAY 

 Crystal Mountain Resort 
Site of the 2003 GNYS! 

 Check out Crystal Mountain 
at their Website 
www.crystalmountain.com 

  

  

 The Yoot website is under 
construction by our web 
Bassmaster…stay tuned. 
 

  
www.yootshoot.com 
 

 * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 
Yootshoot Facts 
Stroh’s Signature Beer 

 was passed around on the 
18th green in 1996. ummm 

 Only 17 different names 
appear on the Yoot Cup 
since 1994…amazing. 

  

Yoot Productions 
6749 Granger Dr. 
Troy, Mi.  48098 
www.yootshoot.com 
 

Just Go To The Cup 

 
Mountain Ridge #5 

Get a good look at the hole 
above...study it closely…look at the 
contours of the green   Picture your 
perfectly hit shot gently gliding through 
the air right toward the pin, landing 
softly on the green and rolling right into 
the cup! But instead of just giving high 
fives to your playing partners, you 
immediately start screaming at the top 
of your lungs, wildly jumping up and 
down, and then do somersaults all the 
way down the hill to the green.   All 
because you have just won $5000!!!  
That’s right, a Hole-In-One on the 
signature hole #5 at the Mountain Ridge 
Course will make you $5000 richer (or 
poorer since you’ll have to buy 84 
people a drink in the clubhouse)!  The 
Mountain Ridge course will be played 
on Saturday at the Yoot Shoot.  

More Yoots, Your 
Honor 
The Yoot ranks have topped out at 84 
participants and 6 non-golfers for 2003, 
filling the complete hotel and studio 
accommodations at Crystal Mountain! 
However, we are still in need of a few 
more golfers to fill out some foursomes.   
Please have additional golfers contact 
Yoot Shoot Headquarters at  
ceo@yootshoot.com. 

Just One More Night 

 
Betsie Valley hole #9 in fall colors 

Response has been very good for those 
of you who will be staying the Thursday 
night before the Yoot Shoot and taking 
advantage of the free certificate good 
for one round of golf on the Betsie 
Valley course.   About half of the group 
have reserved their rooms for the 
Thursday night stay.  The rate of $79.00 
per room is a special price being offered 
to the group. (This is per ROOM, not 
per person)  Crystal Mountain has 
informed me that they will now collect 
this additional money when you check 
in on Thursday, and I will NOT be 
collecting this money with the final 
payment as previously stated.  Upon 
check-in, Crystal Mountain will imprint 
one credit card from each room for any 
incidental charges to the room during 
the weekend and to cover the extra 
nights lodging. 
If you are interested in coming up for 
the extra night and golfing on Thursday, 
please let me know before August 8th . if 
you haven’t already.  This is a great 
opportunity to use the free certificate.  
The certificate is good for one year but 
cannot be used on Friday, Saturday or 
Sunday of the Yoot.  So if you don’t use 
it Thursday, you will be making another 
trip up to use it. 
We currently have blocked tee times for 
the extra Thursday round starting at 
11:03am and continue to 1:18pm.  If 
you have a problem making the early 
start time Thursday, contact me and I 
will arrange a later time.  Other than 
that, I will assign tee times for those 
playing on the Thursday round. 
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